
Buck’s Night Fundraiser 2024
Dear Bucks Night Attendee, 

Please help us celebrate over 30 years since the founding of Star Prairie Fish and Game as a local, non-profit 
organization formed to ensure the preservation of the local Wisconsin outdoors for all people to enjoy.  The 
money raised by SPF&G is spent locally, fulfilling the club’s mission statement. 

Some of our projects include; 

• Building Fish Cribs in Cedar Lake

• Senior Pontoon Ride with over 200 attendees

• High School Scholarships

• Local Grant Program Awards

• Public use pavilion at the north Cedar Lake landing

• Partnering with USF&W, WI DNR, US park Service and other local organizations for land
acquisition

• Funding for the Riverwood Nature Center in Star Prairie

Bucks Night banquet will be held on Monday, November 18, 2024 at Ready Randy’s Sports Bar & Grill (1492 
131st St, New Richmond). This year’s dinner will be buffet style with many side dishes and an assortment of 

appetizers. Social hour and games will begin at 5:00 p.m. with the dinner buffet starting at 6:45.

Buck’s Night is a fun filled evening of raffles, games, auctions and high-quality guns to be given away, 
including shotguns, rifles, pistols and black powder rifles! There will be multiple winner take all manufacture 
specific raffle boards. We will again hold a special attendance drawing of 20 prizes that includes 3 guns, cash, 
and other quality items. A live auction, consisting of 6 dinner cakes with 3 outstanding guns drawn from the 6 
winning cake bidders. 

Your banquet reservation with payment must be received no later than October 15 to be eligible for the Early 
Bird Drawing of a Savage Axis II in 7MM-08.

***Please help us reduce our carbon footprint by registering and paying online at www.spfg.org. There will be 
no extra fee for paying with a credit card***

SPACE WILL BE LIMITED to 275 attendees to ensure we have a quality event. Any remaining tickets after Nov. 
2 will be offered to the general public. No tickets will be sold at the door.  

We are again offering Buck’s Bucks, scrip that can be used on any raffle, game, or auction at Bucks Night. 
These must be purchased in advance with your reservation. You have 2 options this year; $120 in Buck’s 
Bucks for every $100 you submit or $720 in Buck’s Bucks for every $500 submitted.  Buck’s Bucks will not be 
sold at the door. Credit cards will be accepted as a method of payment for auction items. 

Dinner tickets are $75.00, which includes an entry into the special 20 prize attendance drawing. You also have 
the opportunity, at $20 per chance, to enter in our Special Dinner Gun Raffle for a Browning A-Bolt with 
Engraved Stock in .30-06.

If you are unable to register online at www.spfg.org, enclosed you will find an addressed return envelope to 
return your banquet reservation. Your paid ticket, prepaid Special Dinner gun tickets, and Buck’s Bucks will be 
held for you at the check in desk. Requests beyond the 275 limit will be notified or returned.   

We’re looking forward to seeing you on the evening of Nov 18th and thank you in advance for your continued 
support of Star Prairie Fish and Game!
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